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We know all the trends in bags, shoes, hats and other accessories that will triumph in 
2021. But what if your prescription glasses were the star accessory that you have not 
been paying attention to? For many years they were reviled, relegated exclusively to 
use at home and replaced by contact lenses. But, in recent times, we have seen how 
prescription glasses have been reborn, claiming their usefulness and even becoming an 
object of desire for fashion specifiers. So much so that the use of non-prescription 
glasses has spread to become a popular fashion. This year, prescription glasses could 
become the star accessory of all your looks, and the Mango collection for Opticalia 
promises to create many needs among design lovers. 

 

                



 

 

The Mango brand is characterized by enhancing the unique and personal style, with a 
constant renewal of its collections. His designs convey a Mediterranean nature and 
always at the forefront, which has conquered millions of consumers around the world. 
The Spanish firm has become one of the favorites of fashion prescribers, thanks to that 
particular vision of design and trends. This essence is also transferred to his eyewear 
collections, designed exclusively for Opticalia and which, like all Mango creations, have 
millions of followers. The designs presented for this 2021 could become the object of 
desire of the most demanding consumers. 

 

In the proposal for 2021, the frames made with quality materials, modern design and a 
marked contemporary character stand out. Geometric shapes, XXL designs and retro-
inspired frames once again set the trend in prescription glasses. Although, of course, 
there are also more classic options for those looking for a minimal and timeless 
accessory to wear on any occasion. 

 

Among the colors used for the glasses in this new Mango collection for Opticalia, the 
neutral ones that are repeated season after season stand out, such as black, brown 
and nude tones, which are among the most acclaimed. Metallic frames also gain 
strength, both in gold and silver, which decorate the lighter and more minimalist 
designs. And finally, the large glasses with geometric shapes are presented in pastel 
tones, adopting that retro air that has generated so much demand in recent months. 

A collection of trendy, versatile, timeless prescription glasses adapted to all tastes and 
budgets. 



                

 


